
Housing and Community Development Committee Page 1 of 2 Printed 4/20/2017

HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT COMMITTEE
Committee Meeting

Monday - April 24, 2017, 6:00 PM
Committee Room – 2nd Floor – City Hall

AGENDA
(Posted online: 4/20/17 at 7:11 AM)

1. Approval of the April 3, 2017 Minutes

2. 202497: Discuss (Ballantyne) – That the Superintendent of Schools share plans with the 
Ward 7 Alderman to mitigate the negative student enrollment at the West Somerville 
Neighborhood School caused by the proposed Clarendon/North Street Public Housing 
project.

3. 202995: Discuss (Niedergang, Davis) – That the Director of SPCD redesign the asphalt 
front playground at the Kennedy School and work with all stakeholders to make it usable by 
more people for a broader range of activities.

4. 202308: Discuss (Ballantyne) – That the Director SPCD request a redesign and upgrade to 
the asphalt playground, tot lot and “cave” courtyard at the West Somerville Neighborhood 
School.

5. 203091: Recommend Requesting approval of the 2017-2018 HUD One Year Action Plan, 
for CDBG, HOME, and ESG programming and the revised Community Participation Plan.

6. 203069: Discuss (Niedergang, Davis, Connolly, Rossetti, Sullivan, White Jr.) – That the 
Director of Capital Projects update this Board on the West Branch Library renovation plans 
and timeline, including possible dates for the next community meeting.

7. 202620: Discuss (Niedergang) – That the Director of SPCD, Director of Engineering, 
Commissioner of Public Works, ADA Coordinator, and Mayor’s Office work with the Ward 
5 Alderman to convene a community meeting in February to discuss improvements in the 
streetscape on Murdock Street.



Housing and Community Development Committee Page 2 of 2 Printed 4/20/2017

8. 202876: Discuss (Niedergang) – That the Director of SPCD report to this Board on plans to 
utilize the $220,000 in traffic mitigation funds paid by Maxwell's Green, and whether they 
can be used for improvements at Cedar Street, Murdock Street, and the “Patch” 
neighborhood west of Maxwell’s Green.

9. 203217: Discuss (McLaughlin) – That the Director of SPCD provide, by 4/18/17, an 
assessment of the FRIT Assembly Square development's compliance with the PUD and the 
intent of the Ordinance, and of its compliance with the levels in effect at the time of the 
PUD preliminary master plan approval.


