Summary- All Fleet Bid Results for Fleet 2019

. . . . Bid Reference Exhibit . Lowest Pricing including trade-in pricing / up- . Se_cc_)nd Lowe§t !Dricin_g _including Trace-in
Item Description Quantity Department Trade-in Details Lowest Bidder |_ . .. Second Lowest Bidder |pricing /up-fitting pricing & Extended
Number Reference fitting pricing & Extended Warranty Warranty
Unit Price: $33,119.00 Upfitting Unit Price: $33,905.00 Upfitting
_ o Price: $15,550.00 Warranty: Price: $16,750.00
W-1 F-350 Utility 1 W&S Not applicable IFB#19-47 BExhibit A Kelly Ford $2.915.00 Total Price: Bonnel Ford Warranty: $3,015.00 Total
$51,581.00 Price: $53,670.00
Unit Price: $31,545.00 Upfitting Unit Price: $42,033.00 Upfitting
FORD Super Duty _ o Price: $8,500.00 Warranty: Price: $5,450.00 Warranty:
W-10 F-150 1 W&S Not applicable IFB#19-47 Bxhibit B Bonnel Ford $2.595.00 Total Price: Kelly Ford $2.395.00 Total Price:
$42,640.00 $49,878.01
Unit Price: $37,871.00 Upfitting Unit Price: $40,220.00 Upfitting
wW-4 FORDE_USPS(e)r Duty 1 W&S Not applicable IFB#19-47 Exhibit C Kelly Ford Prgé:;:%(gS0.00 Total F\:\:‘air(r:?:ty. Bonnel Ford Warranty: $3, 1:86060 $95,000.00 Total
$98,486.00 Price: $101,370.00
Unit Price: $26,458.00 Upfitting Unit Price: $24,455.00 Upfitting
FORD Transit _ . Price: $3,250.00 Warranty: Price: $7,500.00 Warranty:
w7 Connect Cargo Van 1 WE&S Not applicable IFB#19-47 Bibit D Kelly Ford $2,235.00 Total Price: 2l el $2,435.00 Total Price:
$31,943.00 $34,390.00
W-32 MACK 6 Wheeler 1 W&S Not applicable IFB#19-47 Exhibit E No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




