S22 NAMES

Proposed Legislation to Strengthen Somerville's Inclusionary Zoning Requirements
: 373
s ot -5 P 33

INCLUSIONARY ZONING PROVISIONS: CH’#}-»%" SUllLE, MA

THE SOMERVILLE ZONING ORDINANCE IS HEREBY AMENDED, AS FOIJL&V[S,}'{% WSWE THE
WHEREAS, development pressure in Somerville is jeopardizing the affordability of our City's housing stock; causing
displacement; threatening the socioeconomic and demographic diversity that is so essential to our City's character;
jeopardizing the ability of Somerville families to continue their children’s educations in the Somerville Public School
system; and making it increasingly unaffordable to live, work, play, and raise a family in the City we call home;

AND WHEREAS permits for new housing development continue to be approved and are subject only to the existing
and outdated inclusionary zoning requirements, while the City develops a new zoning code which will likely include
higher inclusionary requirements;

AND WHEREAS any such new zoning will not be enacted until sometime after mid-2016, causing Somerville to lose
out on dozens and perhaps hundreds of new inclusionary units that would have been developed under the
anticipated higher requirements;

AND WHEREAS we anticipate that certain other changes, such as expanded income tiers, will be made to the
inclusionary housing provisions in the full zoning overhaul, and we will support such changes, but we believe that
the following changes are urgent;

Now THEREFORE, be it adopted by the Board of Aldermen, in session assembled, that the below listed sections of
the Somerville Zoning Ordinance are hereby amended to provide for an immediately effective increase in the
inclusionary zoning rate and implementation of the accompanying provisions.

1. Article 13: Inclusionary Housing is hereby amended in the first paragraph of Section 13.2, Applicability as
follows (additions are bolded and underlined and deletions are erossed-eut):

The provisions of this Article shall apply to all residential developments seeking special permits with site plan
review to develop eight{8) six (6) or more dwelling units, whether new construction, substantial rehabilitation,
Planned Unit Development, residential conversion, or adaptive reuse. Developments shall not be segmented or
phased in a manner to avoid compliance with these provisions. No provisions of this Article shall substitute for
any other provisions of this Ordinance.

2. Article 13: Inclusionary Housing is hereby amended in Subsection 1 "Rental” of Section 13.3.3, Affordability
as follows (additions are bolded and underlined and deletions are crossed-out):

13.3.3. Affordability. Housing affordability under this Article means:

|. Rental: Payment of housing and related costs for rental units shall be set at the following levels:

(a) in the case of low-income households, rental costs (including utility costs for heat, electricity, water,

and hot-water, and including access to all amenities that are typically offered to a tenant in the

building, such as parking, access to an onsite gymnasium, and other such amenities.) shall be
set at a level not to exceed the then current "LOW HOME" RENTS published by HUD for its Home

Investment Partnership Program at 24 CFR 92 as they may be amended from time to time. These rents
are set by HUD to be affordable to households with incomes up to fifty (50) percent of area median
income.

(D) in the case of low moderate-income households, rental costs (including utility costs for heat, electricity,
water, and hot water, and including access to all amenities that are typically offered to a tenant
in the building, such as parking, gymnasium, etc.) shall be set at a level not to exceed the then
current "HIGH HOME" RENTS published by HUD for its Home Investment Partnership Program at 24
CFR 92 as they may be amended from time to time. These rents are set by HUD to be affordable to
households with up to eighty (80) percent of area median income.

-1-



3. Article 13: Inclusionary Housing is hereby amended in Section 13.3 General Requirements by adding a new
Subsection 13.3.7 Tenancy Preservation, as follows:

4,

13.3.7. Tenancy Preservation. Leases for the rental units cré%{éd%&ie—? 516 Er)ov%io}s?of this Article 13 shall
provide that tenants occupying such units shall not be evicted at any time except for good cause based on
tenant fault and shall be comparable to the provisions of 12 %Lfﬂﬁ ‘[ ( M governs leases and
evictions for multi-family housing subsidized by the US Depa n Hq)pelgng and rban Development.

Article 13: Inclusionary Housing is hereby amended in the first paragraph of Section 13.3.4, Quantity and

Distribution of Units as follows (additions are bolded and underlined and deletions are srossed-out):

5.

133 4. Quantity and Distribution of Units. Developers shall provide twelve-anrd-a-halfpercent{12.5%) a
m|n imum_of twenty percent 120%[ of the total unlts in the subject development as affordable housmg unlts—

6. Not less than ff'ty percent (50%) of sald affordable unlts shall serve the iower income range households and
the balance of affordable housing units shall serve the higher income range households (as defined in this
article at 13.3.2). Thus, not less than ten percent (10%) six—and—a—qaaﬁelt-pement—(eﬁé%) of the total units in
the development shall serve the lower-income range households. Nothing in this Article shall preclude a

developer from providing more > affordable units than the minimum twelve-and-a-halfpercent-{12.5%) twenty
percent (20%).

Article 13: Inclusionary Housing is hereby amended in Subsection 13.4.1 Establishment and Finding of Need

by striking the last sentence of paragraph (c) and replacing it with the following new sentence:

6.

"As an example, a twenty-six (26) unit project would require 5.2 units (20% of 26) and the last 0.2 unit would
require the appropriate cash payment described in Section 13.4.2."

Article 13: Inclusionary Housing is hereby amended in Section 13.5, Incentives for Provision of Additional

Affordable Housing Units by striking the words "twelve and a half percent (12.5%)" and replacing them with the
words "twenty percent (20%)"

7

Article 13: Inclusionary Housing is hereby amended in Subsection 13.6.2 Fast-Tracking of Permit Process as

follows:

8.

(a) In paragraph (a) by striking the words "twelve and a half percent (12.5%)" and replacing them with the
words "twenty percent (20%)"

(b) In paragraph (b) by striking the words "twelve and a half percent (12.5%)" and replacing them with the
words "twenty percent (20%)"

(c) In paragraph (c) by striking the words "fourteen percent (14%)" and replacing them with the words "twenty-
two percent (22%)" and by striking the words "seven percent (7%)" and replacing them with the words
"eleven percent (11%)"

(d) In paragraph (d) by striking the words "twenty-five percent (25%)" and replacing them with the words “forty
percent (40%)"

Article 13: Inclusionary Housing is hereby amended in Subsection 13.6.3 Fee Waiver as follows (additions are

bolded and underlined and deletions are srossed-out):

13.6.3. Fee Waiver. In cases where a project includes fourteen-percent{14%) twenty-two percent (22%) or
more affordable housing units and where a minimum of seven—pepeeqt—(»?—»é} eleven percent (11%) of the total

project units are provided for low-income households, various permit and hearing fees may be waived at twice

the percentage of affordable housing provided (e g. fourteen{14) twenty-two (22) percent affordable/twenty-

eight(28) forty-four (44) percent fees waived) for projects which include up to twenty-fourpercent(24%) thirty-
nine percent (39%) affordable units. For projects which include twenty-five-percent{25%) forty percent 140%]

or more affordable units, one hundred percent (100%) of fees may be waived. The SPGA shall establish
guidelines for administration and applicability to various fees in its adopted Rules and Regulations.



-

9. The Office of Strategic Planning and Community Development (OSPCD) is herein authorized and directed to
develop a citywide application process and waiting list for all units of inclusionary housing. OSPCD is herein further
authorized and directed to develop a preference system whereby priority points are assigned to households that:

o Are Somerville residents; and .
e Would be income eligible for inclusionary units of rental housing; and 015 pey - B

¢ Have been displaced from Somerville within the twelve months prior to the date of application for an
inclusionary unit, or have been displaced subsequent to their application for an mp!,upipr}a it; or are at
imminent risk of such displacement, and their actual displacement or risk of dlspiac ﬁré&&ﬁﬁfcg
beyond their control, including, but not limited to, no fault evictions, and evictions for non- pﬁa(l mehfofﬂ'hht
where shelter expenses (i.e, rent plus utilities) exceed 50% of household income.

Development of these and other guidelines for assigning priority above and beyond date of application shall be
accomplished with guidance from the Affordable Housing Trust, in consultation with the Housing and Community
Development Committee of the Board of Aldermen, and pursuant to a public hearing.

The following citizens of Somerville hereby petition the Board of Aldermen to consider this proposed legislation:

333

Printed Name Signature Somerville Street Address

oo sio 2 DIV S| J16 o 5+

m&f}!lr @e/wm F‘\(L(\Mc (2ermen QTCAQML;,Q'FOZNLI

: J
\ fg\mn C ATe T 9’7/7/)« e {1:5-—\ _ gﬂl’ NounT Vernon

r

L) o, ,
ey [psiesse—| M | o BrcplwSporns
= <~ o

/AW D&Ul\& Cq‘&,&s q L.l\U\LD ey Pchg

b«,ﬂ'i‘ | L.g'\g[gw\c bpr\,_:_n_uQ Lt/{g’{a._.g ‘f’.‘}\ C—’(f w 'STveCf

rene Low/ N/, T Hudson SieeT

ﬁ(n gckivvf,ar //42 g Y [T
Ericten Lucdl %MQJ@VW 11 B EVeretl St

o K)ijan 7}4{&«/ 67% 2 lryng ot

| ; 7 | J
f’mqrui’/ Galclmm Z b T o Ad Veacren A e L p,

STRL




PRECISAMOS DE MAIS MORADIA ACCESIVEL EM SOMERVILLE!

05 0cT -5+P 3 33

Eu apoio a uma emenda a lei de zoneamento de Somerville para aumentar a
percentagem de apartamentos acessiveis em cada n6vopfojets cﬁa'ﬁélﬂ‘légéo do nivel
atual de 12.5% para 20% em toda a cidade. Também dcrédito qle:

A lei de zoneamento inclusivo deve ser
aplicavel a todas as habitagées novas ou
renovadas de 6 ou mais unidades.

Os inquilinos destos apartamentos soélo
devem ser despajados por causa justa.

A definigdo de um apartamento acessivel
deve incluir todos os custos associados com
o apartamento, por exemplo agua,
estacionamento e outros servigos.

Deve haver uma unica lista de espera para
estes apartamentos, e que a preferéncia
deve ir para moradores de Somerville em
risco de despejo ou que foram
recentemente deslocados.

Nome () Assinatura Enderego

il

\an MM XC}(}E H 2re ey, Q/< ) /(5“[’/ /é@r,/uy(/q’gfplﬂ_b

YO Zﬁ( ‘pl_w \_“

2le, Au.» 2

2 v@v\‘lerLL P\ 3




E‘u'\ _,1J

\')il 4

WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SOMERVILLE!

05 0cT -5 P 333
| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code to raise the inclusionary zoning

rate (the percentage of affordable units in apy;new housing development) from the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to/the inckease, | support:

e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

e Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

Name Signature Address
T ldoes Badeings | Fhot st | B naiks Vorins, Sk
_Da» & C).‘I,L; /MM ? Lindew Place
Lauri€e GO/JNV\ /%ﬂ/\ &Y Warren ¥2
Lc«g‘f*ftc\ Aty % O \Welfor SE#2
J AM_ H}MQ- (Z):A CQ—«—)/\ w53 Brosk.Qo»a_\ “/07
Joseph Ceedls; lﬂm Dol 10 Line Ot 3




PRECISAMOS DE MAIS MORADIA ACCESIVEL EM SOMERVILLE!

Eu apoio a uma emenda a lei de zoneamento de Som@rj\;ilig:l)ér% a?méht%ﬁ a
percentagem de apartamentos acessiveis em cada novo projeto de habitagdo do nivel
atual de 12.5% para 20% em toda a cidade. Também' acreditoqaetr fICE

o V1 = A
SOMERVILLE, MA

A lei de zoneamento inclusivo deve ser
aplicavel a todas as habitagoes novas ou
renovadas de 6 ou mais unidades.

Os inquilinos destos apartamentos sélo
devem ser despajados por causa justa.

A definicdo de um apartamento acessivel
deve incluir todos os custos associados com
o apartamento, por exemplo agua,
estacionamento e outros servigos.

Deve haver uma unica lista de espera para
estes apartamentos, e que a preferéncia
deve ir para moradores de Somerville em DI = WA
risco de despejo ou que foram el KA,
recentemente deslocados.

. AFHORDABLE HDUSING CRISIS

Nome Assinatura Enderego
VOvA ﬁ,JA,(%\ VN %m 148 PeAR L ST Somepuille
(/ 2 Ceize Tt |(Blon ; 999 MedQnd S{. #0, o<
Someyu

\mDrY‘Y\oA.u.dT ?MM K QN\/\CLU.% s ?M—#ghj- 40 ot Flrascsd sk, B2




WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SDO3 RVILLE!
1§15 0CT -5 7 & 2

| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code to raise ihe,urmlygfanary zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new hdu§|ﬁ§ yblf?)pment from the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the’ mcrease | support:

e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all )
new or substantially renovated housing g s ag AFFORDABLE HOUSING CRISIS e
developments of 6 or more units. [ :

¢ Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

Printed Name / Signai}u\e Somerville Street Address

Wal LaCroix 7;%/ e A Y Bdlmort

30 [FisJAy W

Cret Kiwpec _ A /
/ﬁoé@i&lﬂjm %ﬁé&w 5§ Lackeley SH-

Cnah v Sivwmanol 70, A— 99 ol St

AN TN KHGV\ h/c;n f/_——, T wWaln 7 \I

| a0m Pc-?pua/‘jf) oL . e |5 fon <

Caipoldoy] et £/ 100 0/ /4

LJ\QG}NV)\ l?LQ‘Q\\ \ (MUWMU\,\‘ \¢ Lela~d (.
Pviovwns Svow N T Zr S — 20% Aighland fe |

1

(cERid BASTeR | Pl §— | ] Apttee S

v

TN L B /\r\a m m\)(}.r\\w N QA2 \Woepen Ave

“) Clhavlotbe ?‘(H’\l Q/(\mem/\ﬁ & /&OW\IOC'VIA A 1L O

Chastre Uw ' 1A = " 1A Juckinghom ST

Ko al SapxoT A ;a,.wi SAhead, ¢ I Avon Ypi Seomadd

l,amﬂw Alamt | g dide— Lo pomicke gt °

/;”e
214Ss

/ (N34 MM/V)’U ‘{6‘/"846‘1 % rown |18 9&0?70?‘1’%‘/ ﬁ#ﬁ




WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SOMERVILLE!

s fT -5 B 3 ;
| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code to %IEJ t?le |§clu3103nary zoning

rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new housing developmen
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the’ aﬁdre%&é*ﬁ uﬂp

Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

Requiring that tenants

may only be evicted for just cause.

Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

Creating a single waiti

inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville

residents who are at

or have been recently displaced.

in inclusionary units

ng list for all

risk of displacement

% %mthe

.AFFGRIJABLE HOﬁs‘mﬁ {RISIS

— AT A

R Printed Name Signature Somerville Street Address
(ldhevwe Forntonda ucftﬁ,«fbkw 24 Ayon ST
TIiNxe CRAUN G5 PANE SI_
frdrevs (zreengpon J4 Postrr 5F. 2 2C
MO‘O\O\‘(Q* \/\\\kw G2 Sylamove ST
d v \omdon d 279 Dewne Me .
W}Mﬁﬁl’& (] [ 1R A bron S
Uhaun ues /T [1e PVt Sy
’WW&M/»J Séﬁi 17 1Baces Sew.
[6 Suwee, ST HS
5 SChes s S2 Beodern \X
Q\ULV\E)\ ?thou( { W Oferd ¥z

5+_Co]/\an e Me‘ l( 4

Z8 Oxfoxd St >

Wauawwz' Miskowh,

%9 RN:wm Wt # 1

(e ik

?’mw}/c (§

30 ﬁaosfrc/ $7-

\_M Cx\ o 61\(\’\9\'6

Tuuiy
Y

(pZ LA\) -\kO Ln)l)[\.‘& \

o B /@‘s

56 [ skon TL




WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN S?MERWLLE!
05 05T -5 P 3 3

| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code to raise t%? inclusionary zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any niéw h@ si’h ment from the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In additioR to't

e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

¢ Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

& increase, | support

Printed Name / Sig[\ature Somerville Street Address
Kathe rine Aexarde K LLad 24 Hgh & Somenille
Wi Yonee [\ el 9y 220000l Sc ¥ L
Raclel Hawlang Doled Yo St [45 Lowrel st #
Ambw Sche W-v— - 213 H‘l}\faml/’rvﬁﬂ@-—

\fmmhtﬁ\w)d\w 1/5,_ 33 ((«oSe,ﬂLmi Sedlp
Y ﬂﬂ%bﬁ J L Y T¢ ARECLEY ST
/\}:c Wees L Z 7 LU Bk Sao iy

Qperee McCroa = S3LEus ST ofw 2 -
e Ggllanty” " \LEw g8 QU
To (s . (J/ = D Bl S
anfé“/ CewdrTz [l Zadl| 7Y Fltam T 543
et T Houw s 10es F‘V’?LEQ Y KA (4. ST p214 3
fﬁﬂAﬁM’ Ve, Bl ! A $chool St

N Nitanl WO~ Q) 116 Cod&r o¥
TF [ '1}(‘ c %df 5 1o (AVDERS SE



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SOMERVILLE!

33
| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code o }g geYthe mcfus%onary zoning

rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new housing deveiopmeﬁ (f,rom the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to tl‘&éﬁlﬁ&bﬁéé ?FQ

e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing B3 AFFORDABLE HOUSING CRISIS
developments of 6 or more units. S

¢ Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

o Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

Printed Name B Sigﬂature Somerville Street Address

MNIOL pRREM( o pJ) AI‘W}/L‘J\/ 18 Kas, miRe (T otlen
o Cedidrn /4/( S lurhk St 3204y
Mem\e Dwens W/UU\/—\« 21 ftaom St
qléx l;/é?crfmc “ é':,—/’%fvz_/L (39 800 4,

‘ KioaA— [ 22 e St (pAC
U (el A2

\mont 4 2
fZ#/Qﬁ/a/‘O( e
' 40 Buycemoe
Go\p Mas s . )ewm 14 i (AT L

O/ﬂﬂ’." omnyUBg ()QL npk- [,Z,m Oo Lt jz’{ C &71/)4/\— St ﬂv

\V\ﬁ(\\&p M(/\\\m\w %\W'a\\/\m Q0 &Y Meaana\\ 5 SO‘MWK\J%‘VL
r’uc(— gﬂ /QVKD Zéé.c«l/é'&nc/t. Lurn)llutf//d

Kathe dony vl (474, T Bakelee] St uagulls | Ut
[ {2a Crovinse - %J{' L 4 3 /U\r-\.mJEmnf1

T (Spilin “{WHW 27 lceixvv@mq e 2



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SOMERVILLE!
05 0c7 -5 P 33U

| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code to ralse the mclu nary zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new housihg ¢ Vel p Cifrom the

i Ed

current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the’ hcreése 1'support;

e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

e Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e (Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

Printed Name ‘ Signature Somerville Street Address —'
S -\ A5 N/ W Z Souromes Beceks
SophieNuek 121 %W/L;,\ 3¢ Huw b, ST A2
%’7 @mmﬁ&/ )2@/\: BRUNEL & |22 ?6]4{2(, Bl
O Lo A — 20 lLale 5t #3

a\er| M\(L\\m W 20 Lale SE ,ﬂr%
wobps ! | [ M s 15 L) S

s r Foar (’/A/N/vo-n Lea | § Leovred ST
Saraln LM%A( quuxﬂ/\ f 22 Holuolea. B H X
Wacha ! Fichiens avr [Q&-JWQ pUGA— L2 \’bf‘«lu\‘@— €+ 2z
Mo, Gistss DN 04t A o2 Hillside Panie.

E('m HUSU{\@/ C/‘—éc)\ 7l e |7 Suwmar S
OHN FINANUGY )] ] P 20 STWE

Ce i Koo = D> N 12 Lo ST

Feanic ANES “ Ao fl"‘l/':\ L 1262 w AT 9 Sen]

Suwmes Mitl sl % . %W 13 éumul//w Steet,22)
o Do AT A Vilewd S

N U )y v



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SOMERVILLE!

msocr-s p 2

31

| support an amendment to the Somervillg z,onmg code to raise the inclusionary zoning

rate (the percentage of affordable units i

Sy R oy

ingdevelopment) from the

current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the'increase, | support:

Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

Printed Name Slgnature Somerville Street Address
64 Caft AWV Z2 Qe |
/44@.,_,, Moeone M"k 32 Wamer— A, g

Ren Poriy HuS

32 wWARREN s 2

[5 WP(\%’\; f)ark :b',

Jaso ;ﬁ\n Narko § &
ﬂﬂv

"AA T 237 Tremonl SH2
%W 1 b 6o ddpin Sy
/%m, A afme/ Va l/70)) [ SURHN T 4F
?o\CK V{‘\)\' fa/ /« 67 Fana-M 5T #¢
Thomae “Tbcld Thonrer 22| 353 BoADAL oy St
T bﬁ% ~lop |1 Marion S 2
/Tﬁ}f// ﬂ?fmn v \%L/// 1S g S) #R
AW\\OQI Hmm\nﬁ‘.bu\_) WfM Hm/\ﬁ/‘l.&/—a:w“ \C{) I\Amf\{\{\oéthjr, )
e T e Tay w3 Munpse S
(ﬁlj(d% Wog. (\;ﬁl)\#e A W’V&\Q’L‘/\ /_..a )JAPW*/\ S)’f?.e ML
%\’\Qm'\n—, P [ o o, A A
P—-e Pf\f! \ v Mﬂ-:év dza.—\.._ H?' { ‘5{-




WE NEED MORE AFF ORDA%I;E HOUSING IN SOMERVILLE!
5 00T -5 P 334

| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code to raise the inclusionary zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units i bﬁy%h‘oﬁﬁqﬁ fdevelopment) from the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In’ addition to thé i increase, | support:

e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

e Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

) Name Signature Addrﬁss
\),94( Pr&ax 2~ 4C0 ng}fﬁf
M. G A PR S Vtrne S
\Julm Sable ;Zdlé‘f//é‘a\ TEE Mt Vegsney 5}‘11_2__‘
WMzgf UpY %M%\ G SIAUNIRE STH 25
\m% bl //,,, (4 AMesina XA\ Sl S
@\C l/\ﬁdfj \gb g4 25 > ' 4// DY Vi r\/,
H v (G~ e 4G L G Jfir
MeliSsa Cofkon]C Pl 0| 95 (iar o, &
M thele LUath’fﬁffé/ N k) B & Swery, le Y
Morla giedes g lloded )5 #elin o KT Soulld.
@ML‘T/LJ\A &’; T i I IBre  ppmse
S \4 (TP, § £ ﬂ/\”‘}“’ﬂ L‘—?'L M{d‘p‘f/{ %\
2 Yl Rola N A p 26 Broa dinay >
Vv dDinblogy | L~y | 75 ¢, (on Pucs
Dlite ELasimian CJ@AM (3 Rebirane S
ﬁmm«v LEwis L (el T AdrTHoens T
Anvie Betaboad Pnos Reetoss 330 Semeniie Ave Ayt 21

"‘J

3
b

\




WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUYSING BEN\gSOMERVILLE!

| support an amendment to the Somerville zoninig ¢dde. tdrai8&ftHe inclusionary zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new’ hbmé:rlrg dé{feiopment) from the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the increase, | support:

e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing B AFﬁJhDﬁBLﬁ R
developments of 6 or more units. fi o SR

e Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement %
or have been recently displaced. B kL IALD.

5 CRISIS i

Printed Name Signature Somerville Street Address

Docoted WQNan | xemPullon, 712 Soncoe FTPY
L;ga }/}vafv \7}; W f L alng {‘"
Cleo Schngs dex gﬁfé/}" %’{/27//[/7 [z Alton €. %7

Ayl g}ﬂ]%“\ PP~ L{L IDU%VMMQ%-&‘/{
e, Yusse | WK\ B 70 Yol Street |,
ZL/V%L /%M ) rnan MJ/./A/ W 5Y Duan /)774,@% S”L,

fsdkt’ijre /67%'\—_/ 1 Vw—(’ Ave.

J \-.._)f 'J
o Sihrtranan (2 (1 Do ST

62‘-(‘,1'\0\!‘3 Hr,g,]e,\./ “%i{ivlv/MA/ qq MVc’C'n(; 51":

EX I o / X s m[\,ﬁf 75 WEBTTER AVE =3
Poodes Qundsia | /7= (00 Consed e )

Grovens, Doy @MM- Perorne | Fpame ne a,mrl

AJ

L/is& OAaé&'é- j)ZOM /03 Cutea/ SJZ. #/
Plex Margle AN 3L Avon $4.
ﬁ\eﬂwﬁmt S+t 0 O AL— | Tremonr ﬂf\cﬂ%\‘ \

2N baomm W 224 Hanlind *2>

@% NSE %W» 67 Walhut ST, 9212



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SOMERVILLE!

rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new hOUSI

current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to tﬁé
Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all

new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units

may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,

parking, and other amenities.

Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference

on that list to income-eligible Somerville

residents who are at risk of displacement

or have been recently displaced.

& O 33
| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code tc% ra|se the [nclusmnary zoning

95‘;9

Lffom the
Ssypport:

Printed Name Slgnature Somerville Street Address
@Mvce Desded | (@rdo ('O\N 108 Pragm fie Spn
(risda’ Rots \/j ED B2 Mumiee ST # 14

LA (C Dol e | 82 P R

__‘EMW Masaia @AM( M s, | 3o Parldale, ST
Carn Kidu X CUAA " 32 Cpogee A ST
pnne e fies Dtz Toeii | /55 Sommer §F HT0R_

OR24rich. foerk W IS Glbbens SI. Ak 2
Phonstasion Mepshele _ 1S Edben SY A2
e Cophetn /LA/\/\VV,. (\ S <t. 2
tﬂtqn[« Whcia Dese P : 24 Ayon St

)aa/y Chliman | SO0~ (S Poedin Howe T 73
fova’+ 5&.(1 ol %4f//// ey 8 Byw <A,

J2n :;qm;}h /e B Clecelead SH
Vg € P, Yok Jf2 Gl A
Vit D {VVW, A | 3 byt S, Kt B3
Vol famedl J O\ 213 Gomme e

6rj4n Simmoc’s

j/MZ/Wu £ 7 tfalyd b O2 493



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SO%/I?IISYILLE'
7015 06T -5

| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code to :—lu§q~ @mgﬂwam&ry zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new housing dévelopnierifyfrom the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the increase, | support:

Requiring that tenants

may only be evicted for just cause.

Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

Creating a single waiting list for all

inclusionary units, and

on that list to income-eligible Somerville

residents who are at

or have been recently displaced.

Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

in inclusionary units

assigning preference

risk of displacement

s g AFFORDABLE HOUSIG CRISS g

Printed Name Signature Somerville Street Address
E\zabeth (offrey | ClmalebD Coffen, [ FLA\proe St
Pt Sau | (22 O (5 ek SE

MARSYA  PomerarT o !%;%/,(,L [~ - 93 Ceretmygl # 3
Didle, Barbvus | U0 e 71 clille.
Eien masoy 1, T/l Hasp— 72 chf o
Tolr Relube DRNS L 4~ Zz& A lbery 32
\eﬂ Sraddacd \‘ SAAT b £sen S
Vﬁna! Mat®rin ) = 50 Boco SF
Bodhan., Bukw\h 95 f»‘if’fm Ax_

[N1ke’ Pacsen

4p Lake 9.

,€S<S|(a L!{b_f.\’t"HCLV\

e

A AL E

Y Bwcler HouSe Tec

e

F)'S\D'Cl C‘aikb(’(‘:\‘i(\a a‘,

=

ZL\ ?C‘kDCLm( Hm:& kﬁ?‘

Jon Ta tobs AW LRI I8 Frospedt S+ 4|
5 \ \rd MO(/(/ w’ﬂ/fﬂ /]\(n)i 1(“(/~C/A7,—€
Ehiecuhendrre wmtny Kl Al 2 fonpt— [ \eiteh b

¢ CL\&(LL é;.c/l_u.fi‘ }Lcﬁﬁ

22 Biamphe SHd |

o /7/%4& galﬁ L

El



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOU

| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code {9 fep?(jzt
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new hougm

G IN SOMERVILLE!

J0T-5p 3 3,

e inclusionary zoning
r&‘ﬁ from the

current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the lncrease f S‘upport
e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all

new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

¢ Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e (Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

, Printed Name

Signature

Somerville Street Address

i .
Jichivia T Mg T [ Swimer €7,
L(,(wu § _Da e e = MaveD ,
Joss 100210800 | A0 A shy Wasll 1,227
¢ Panundsp R AT ~——7 WDmstiNGTod S T
Case Maloriam | ConNacle, | Go Summar S #F
Rae V) Ince\id | se == J | [f IfrJ?névzm%’;/ to
Lodoria Lol AL ALAAID| Y Cortig 9
9@/ Ve 2 Tpilf CoMen) 4L e, ST
(/ Pelntar ZiMvOmo (1L~ (03 Pow Sk
'VPU p Aega~S S /)/@—7— Zi Eoavprin Az
glfs vy (4 g [ﬂ!xf/fuﬁf g{'
kipgamexga;sﬁz\ Ol RE LAaoesL ST
m wma)r\ K\Q\Y‘\ Il Pufm'm St
Pildrve G astes , O Cow SE |
& /Cip g?)h)-—P |~ P %/ 79/[()/%)111%/;75(\
Jacine geeeN | Y < 15 ARLEN"AVE.




WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOU%%\%QT I_I'%I §DO]3YI§II}{VILLE!

I support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code tpraiseitheingiugipnary zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new housing develgpment) from the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the increase, | support:

e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all

new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

e Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

Printed Name Slgnature Somerville Street Address
M grtha Clevelond MJUQL,«J 194 Movisnn P
JNIAN T RCALke ? ’%A WO THyz4rom

Lo o lsh 260 Kchlond Ave.

EMM‘ Sty (< 2l Bowdern S- -

ﬂmpq ’F EALE 4 ﬁﬂ Qb HIEHMWD  4F O I
by W&I%% 152 Hm{dmd/% AL

mu\ ‘\\\C\w«é@c Ay~ 7 Quicy 2.

Me i3 N\(J'L)(\\\Hu,lm (A W—WWA [l Dicksoy st .

MCQK\O\ k;LL

[ lrtr Tt

S/ Aon s

’}-O\ &}"1 S"’OI[ fé(/(

\/Jf\‘\ \{:H’C\ (B( i
Am

Py Cabstt | 11 Prnan.
Franc's Boohoo~ | G 3uotice— 18 Seper o,
Loy Bxidg, AN J5 g Pbion SE
M Callashe | 722 f forlbinle.  |YSSponse [VY
Fdwerd #lly, %uygf MJ 7/ fug St AR
Katerme Milles }JM/u,w J/LLJE— Yl HUUAhhS Q‘/, H2




WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUS}}N%}N,;S%I\%E%{VILLEI
LS T

| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code %_Tr‘ékisptejtm'gm@]kﬁf
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new housh‘v’g‘*d*é‘vﬁélopme@')

ary zoning
rom the

current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the increase, | support:

Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

Printed Name Signature Somerville Street Address
FK_‘(':D, Berman) | Snedonc [ PBoime | AT Charny
Cha ‘m[d r\ﬁ [N M/‘\ﬁw;{,% 17 Chewvx) et
Lori Sesall” o IN a5 Clary S
Aizeloetin Stagl | 2 20 Spving 1l 12
Pin Hom & 7 T Tolod Tt
fx\'\\zk_ AndhiSiw 7 /, /L'\\ @2_/’”\6\1\‘\“-' sk 4 )
(e Vs b 3¢ HF s
Emily [Erdman LN 20 Thorpe S
Powmy uoka- | I W == |\ peospea i
Shucd L echin, e 6 Hospnct Nol!

Leniw Diddonso Il a2~

Z5 ch»a:fl/lw %{' Y i

FI:B\Y\’\Q—\—\GF\M«'\ v\

24 ¢ (dle_<t

B

[AADELEY <

INNAR RSN

e CLL

B Alpine St =+ |

3L Sppnf e

/M

[ ©b gbtwg,rt’l@f'<

(= ETTITCTN



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOIZTB%[NG—Q\I §%RVILLE'

I support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code e raise the inglysionary zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new housing:developrmient) from the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the increase, | support:

Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement

AFTORDAL K1 RIS

-t -.l
e '

.|
)]
s._J

-@;ﬁff}‘caqubﬂ JP??@E:@@ ﬂM@xggL e gl

Seila Jaceson KUy B~ |iop Ceacon St F2

L-Osu\(";t G‘Oléﬂ'\o-l’\ [\7[)&/\._‘ QU( w&frey\ fﬁ,ve ‘u"l

i\j §

cm;)he,(( /‘//?/«/W % Sihe) S i

or have been recently displaced. A IR PO .
Name Signature Address

EMILY POLAE- P 7 HAMLET ST. QPTA

A/hirf/w N sen W S " |{ How 4l ton St A /
Emdy, ST Z vl o M T 361 Waghingren ST fomeri)
Guatily, Ml | Zan s AN [ G2 aucel S
)Q@%Brﬂ(’(/ax L«‘(i W% (€Y slen gt Aot Z
Mot ML adgf A rn.uxﬁ Marzum 1‘7\'3 r’mf [ 4

\J\’\\\ QUVAN Cf_;\/\a\*\i" ‘&/W Q\;W\M—f"\ R --+oW 2z

il Mual P 1R 3% cavcere 8¢
Ada  Floes_. M@{ Hrrs,F e, 2| Lhden Srread
g ( Mﬁ/ﬂ(ﬂlﬂﬁu i !T(‘h.:wc‘ erm c?é‘/- M/:Lfﬁ.'n,sﬂz;-m LA
(U 4 :Dcr—qﬁ( Wfﬁ? | [ 1 ,S{ kv €| th-
rq .3 ﬁ/e’ﬂ/f 4/,\0( /}’Zf/ 4 /4///74/7 5E somerl/ /e



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSENG IN SOMERVILLE!

I support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code’ tﬁlréi“ée {H¢ inélusionary zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new hohsn‘rg &éve!opment) from the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the increase, | support:

e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

e Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

 AFFORDABLE ROUSING CRISIS g

Name Signature Address
A \ﬂéa(é%ﬂ e Y ol
ludsoa e[ Jonda Sl e R e 2
Dy Kl s, P LN
Raoletia @ Swa | o B,Q\ EA RS \HS Peand [ ok, omacil( < MA
IRINR TR W 4 (1 empoed fd Somi >6‘

Ao Milor 7Y A /ﬂ?ﬂw/ 237 Tvemon] STtenbrvilie
[—\dduf 22 Wi ve v e AN/ z,f//%,.ainmaf/a/ﬁ NV
(v wl.U 7 A m%% TSI 277

fs@n,:{a.h fc'\&—u’/m i %— 1 cdmeq Ter

’Q(] G\QW\S Ql?\d th o £ 7 mfwfi&-, 6201 Salv‘\’-‘-ui/“’e.
\SMU\//\ (\c\:\:\-’l’;?C\f‘C\ % o <0 g,gélf Qd SOM- N’\A
Plandidics S lve (-7&4 -./:.»l(, £ LGL(,,M Y58 Moo el SV -

f: fencha\fal Co SN \W ’c-vme.,’///
oloPupre ( }/A}(,'

¥ T
4 sty s e & | "
{ J Curedorus b/ %}%ﬂw—/ 207 Peod - ik S galle 4 A8




WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SOMERVILLE!

rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new housingdevetopment) from-

w05 0c1-51 0 335
I support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code to raise the inclusionary zoning
the

current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the increase;: l'Suppqrtﬂ
e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all

new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

e Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

Name / Signature Address
Jﬂ&,—! /u_'rn- }4’{(’__6 /\}f?" i ﬁ?,%{/c 2 ;;)é ;wf,d'c’}_,_\ﬁ ]' 3 7¢'f' j,:’{’ifmvé%kﬁ( / (l:gf‘ﬂuw' /’/f‘t’l/#{/)

Karen Narvrefs 1"“')

,z::/;w

43 p Pewry St RS, Somenville

\J:}\n (f‘}lﬂ il

§4L 1T Vernens l<.f*.ia (-

/rile MA

(an/ CA)—K}

I"')"n ;\E”J" / Aa——r/\ < %3] 3-¢y—JJ" juwfu/f ¢ u.»(a' DL“'!b
~GN B \Pu\)]r\m y!%(ﬁl/x&(ﬁf (d ) LAY ”f‘ffﬂ’? 0/( 7 718 Som A Aty
Azﬂmfﬁﬂfc, /KMW"Q/A //MM ﬁt)%v’w:l?k Y/ éa%’ﬁ(@ﬂ*(/ﬂfé G2
Roso Da Silve, Reso. Do QJ&L’& 2Y Ho.‘l"bQTm St Sevi MA o2 IlINY
STAQUELY NE  SQUZA L | TAQUES ST same Ry LLE_&Q/Z/j"
Ram Judacy el Zog Loy A 51 Souda) (10
Wl s oollyde | A5 | v, flgar~<igoapecsde
Mary JoPA s | Plavy F]epf? 1) Selallaf AOLIO]
Dw s Hf _Sam i}uﬁ ) = 3 simm -+ ALE
Dee__Ohy) DAEs O X Vinet sl Sor
\/axler\ci Zinkus walowic Jinjun | Gl Wheste md St
/? ( = | i mb‘ e o \.C-;I 1/5 (\D‘G‘rr»‘x ~ AV{, —eprecs 11X
L_ﬂ.ur*&, DU'\WO/\ A - ( e (0) laville.

Se=

esllezg WL ¥4 8\ S
]



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSINGIN-SOMERVILLE!

| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning cc‘;dé‘focr
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new hou5|

nilsdée&ld

A¢lisionary zoning
ment) from the

current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the increase, | support:

Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all

new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units

may only be evicted for just cause.

parking, and other ame

nities.

Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,

Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville

residents who are at risk of displacement

or have been recently displaced.

Name

Signature

Address

ij%am

DS mvﬁ o} Sl

L

75 t/ﬁwruzf 7~ y//

A
MAXim e L era,p 3 //érw—y Ualcbo.
\)05%9;\ S VA YS )(Zggw—a}\ X~ 19 6Ly 77 pPT 2
AGNA Oef'tu’ ‘ M ) I (vecomend A ’ff“}
E)Dﬂ )/ \N’A/;]C:Dr‘}' /—@hjﬂ Wé)\ Z Redelny 44 2ovenll ’
l aviy Kapersu C /3 5 (X /9 ﬁ.,},\n.(&‘?_ggo:—(em.‘%“
W Le

Ak %ne NoNCouR]

H2 pepRY ST K3 J0MERY

ng,.y ol OJ’Y/L

Y3 ey SHE3 Spmrith

-~

/j”‘?”// Je Gr)}»@//

Sf%{/m/ﬂ/za {"%S Mﬁ»&

v

3¢ MMM S

r

L.

ol

/0"

37 Myvshedl S

5

/J/PMM A

\U

72 Lz z

/jS/Q Ceatraf jfﬁecpf‘

/,M)Lasm M Mv? 76 /J’V//?i\j Y7
p‘r\@u\& Q) L@"r(ﬁ/\\r- (QL(\@ \\AQ\A( (,}7— ‘}\-&\%&AC(Q\U €. S ma QKLJJ_L(}(_Q
Jahn CaTer m Calin Bsmzz Ve brpr, ST
S 6[{,\,\ P L’{o(! ff’ oz
\Jﬂ-& C}J—&C[é MA G i, géfz/% AJJ ~21\ %N& /9b€ C’ij? |

4

/



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SOMERVILLE!

ms ocr -5 P 335
| support an amendment to the Somerville zoning code to raise the inclusionary zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new, housing developpient) from the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addition to the incteasé:| support:

¢ Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all
new or substantially renovated housing
developments of 6 or more units.

e Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

¢ Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

Name S‘igngture Address
ANl cnp®sthy | DT YU HRaRTST 272 Qo
GHIVA  BHANDART e 1G9 WASHINGToN ST SoMgRviLLE
e } ‘::-l;(-;\,l-\ (oo @\)‘vu =t IQM e,
LAAIa gangzy %ﬁfﬁé 232 Fal b AVe Soregpulle
PRITW B ParcOES - G17 Gomeratlic fre
Bakskn  SuRES THA | It — et Somevilg sl
Mo tfless Bearn e | 3D Nachw S
MI;THL{W g//n(' W//%’ — C(’Lf d‘ Somevi/id <4
Tes bhuwan  Shvesin| T3 o 5% Mumsliedd §} Setile
somay K hatel S ST VLN F1s Redbo cd ad o ) g flie -
Jaermswva o§P A hwudaA 2356 [owell X Pma) (|4
,/"ﬂi’am Colear \#’% s Broafesay G- \N1 €
wltre dg RY/e g |HEZ Brgdied et
Waone
Gl g Mg Caryery Cohmtrgome Cursr] 365 [piuell S som:r}ﬁ:‘ Jpa

Wanraml R ol Ctuygmae=1 WY 3 cLy DA 51 %en
A\ <) 2y =

M3 PP+
(2



WE NEED MORE AFFORDABLE HOUSING IN SOMERVILLE!

%o 35
| support an amendment to the Somerville zoriﬁ'\b cone fo raise the inclusionary zoning
rate (the percentage of affordable units in any new hou 1%grge\4ﬂopment) from the
current level of 12.5% to 20% citywide. In addﬁtlon &Q gq incrgase, | support:

e Making inclusionary zoning applicable to all”
new or substantially renovated housing Y
developments of 6 or more units.

¢ Requiring that tenants in inclusionary units
may only be evicted for just cause.

e Basing the affordability of a unit on all costs
associated with the unit, including water,
parking, and other amenities.

e Creating a single waiting list for all
inclusionary units, and assigning preference
on that list to income-eligible Somerville
residents who are at risk of displacement
or have been recently displaced.

Name Signature Address

Zueispotze T FLYNV M,._)):%# 10 Sewate T & WZ
Michae L Bucgsss U\M&M 10Se ol St 199 Sms
Hf"'-/ ?anj Da(rac.ﬁ .‘-é?/{t,.m r(? 7. 7 :‘ \ld 5%:’/4»4//5"

Yol Wl Miam _.4; LW

Tast /. ,\/7’/{) /S SE V‘//:L!« S/ m’fﬁﬂ
/m 4M/f)*// A | /ﬂ/ 4’//«7%“ 2%‘)7)///4/ )p/",w
ﬂA‘w’:/hA /¢! aC/‘\ %M e all /5 /mw/ f?fj// ~

wdi i

‘\jibtjgé/ SIPPTIOS™

/.

x'f

" M;; ,f%{ﬁ;’( S /r/)mvfﬂam 18 Sewall s34 /0%




iINECESITAMOS MAS VIVIENDA ASEQUIBLE EN SOMERVILLE!
05 orT -5 P 3 38

Yo apoyo un cambio a la ley de zonificacion de Somerville para incrementar el
porcentaje de vivienda asequible en nuevos projectas Béllacti:ﬁﬁ’l Q@% a 20% en toda
la ciudad. Ademas creo que:

e La ley de zonificacion debe aplicar a cada
proyecto nuevo o remodelado de 6 o mas ;.,-. AFFD DABLE HOUSING CRIS!S :

unidades.

e Los inquilinos de estos apartamentos solo
deben ser desalojados por causa justa.

e La definicion de un apartamento asequible
debe incluir todos los costos asociados
con el apartamento, inclusos agua,
parqueo, y otros servicios.

o Debe haber una sola lista de espera para
estos apartamentos, y que la preferencia
debe ir a los residentes de Somerville en
riesgo de desalojo o que han sido recién
desalojados.

I

. Nombre/ om ¢ FirmaSy iedde Direccién Mﬂ) 5

i He 'l MR 2 Wesley Fa ’“‘k Sem't |/,
MULA R mpR ke MACH LLERANK LW AVE sopm
Sankboclhh (i _Aﬁ ¥ (9 waldwgtlen 1} . (dhenille

52 vind) oveTTdoman'ing
6z Ythod Ave FEPt 2.
e vivsd fve gt o

e -
&eWWWJL

e 7L0r-——‘e“’5/




INECESITAMOS MAS VIVIENDA ASEQUIBLE EN SOMERVILLE!

Yo apoyo un cambio a la ley de zonificacion de Somerville para incrementar el
porcentaje de vivienda asequible en nuevos projectos del actual 12.5% a 20% en toda
la ciudad. Ademas creo que:

¢ La ley de zonificacion debe aplicar a cada
proyecto nuevo o remodelado de 6 o mas by e o o APFORDABLE Hﬂusms CRISIS
unidades. W

e Los inquilinos de estos apartamentos sélo
deben ser desalojados por causa justa.

¢ La definicion de un apartamento asequible
debe incluir todos los costos asociados
con el apartamento, inclusos agua,
parqueo, y otros servicios.

e Debe haber una sola lista de espera para
estos apartamentos, y que la preferencia
debe ir a los residentes de Somerville en

nnnnn

riesgo de desalojo o que han sido recién "F’.i‘ - _ j__#'"j{},,a,-fw,éw;;_;,
desalojados.
. Nombre ;M‘.m\ ¢ Firma§\ﬂ e o Direccion P(&ﬂ} SS
AN He A Mew iR 7‘%%;/&/ ?“ﬂk -gf)m/(—r /{*t
MAZD kU MAR kel NACA A RBNELIN B i/é“ B
S(m{\-o.g'lr\ Gin | qﬂn\nk? # {9 walngley (. (groniily,
a1 W EQ_ valQ O\V{:F%CDHWV'I £V
&ewwnmy4x,, e b Ythod ave Bpt 2

f\fjlxq %vr.,w—?vvﬁ % Go V1MJ ﬁ'va ipr}Z




woo ooyel@uelapjuiuyiey
woo lewb@mm w us)siy
WO lewBbmoINOAIZS

wod |lewb@puasumoluy
woo lewb@susnsiswuuar
woo [rewb@Aelow|ooo

wo?'jlewb@uesoew W Asupnoo
woo ooyeA@o|s™ yleq Ajjoy
woo'lewb®@ |/ | Jenbelewew
woolewb@niya e’ |seydin
wodjlewb@bulgowl

WO YoSoOMIDIeUOL

woo lewb@esoNggeluod

woo ewb@pieyulaqg Aoueu
Wwoo'|lewloy®)||epus)s
woo'lewb@isuuus
Wwoo'lewjoymuebalfiew

woo oun(@easijdnpg
18U)seowoo®gsIql

Wwoo |lewuocioid@A|eyoyd

woo'jlewb@uosdwoy} wepe'uaq
woo'joe@esasueleuus|

wod lewb@¢ L obeipw

woo joe@idoysafor
18U"1SEOWOI@ ABUUIYMOLLIL

woo lewb@uiswiedesusas|
woolewb® | gbiagsieameigaqg
wod'lewb@uoleynys-uaing|

jlews

1eaug (InIL GL

vr120 Y allinawos 1S ybiH L1

SAY MOJIM 12

EV1LZ0 YN 8llIiniawWog ‘¢# 1S ddeuy g
1s 9pA|D e6

bg JawoH o}

¥¥L20 YIN ITINAYINOS JAVY INNOWHIVH |
1S Yadsold #0L

YIN _w___EwEom .Hm EOEmo)w v

1S 3ANIATV L2

S¥120 ‘YN @lliiawWwos 6# 1S 9pA1D 6
£#1994)G |leysiel /8

BNUBAY JBpPIM L1

€# 100413 |leysiep /8

}98.1S UMOPIOA /6

VIN 8lliAlawos IS Head 922

peoy puelybiy gy

anuaae uosdwis g¢

198.)S Swepy i

v¥LZ0 VIN ‘3|IIaWOS *aAy UOSHION Z0|
a|jiAlaWIS }S UOSPNH 69|

‘@AY sawer 1S /4

£ 120 BlIlBWOS € IS Jawwng 9|
VIN @Bpuque) }S jsaio4 G|

€# 9AY PIOJUOD ZL L

pi1L20 slliMewos 19a1S 1epad g |
Py pudmiayn oy

plexoed 9|

vr1LZ0 BN ‘9|iuewos 3S uosyoIa 9|
1S uBwd /|

0654 1eays Bunquoyy |

rr1L20 VI ‘9jiiAewos ‘peoy pukmiayd 9y
odaiapul / UCIDDBII(] / SSBIPPY

uelary ufiyyey
Jaoy|assap) usisiy
JIAOAIZ 3108
puasumo] JayjesH
SusAals uusp

[00D2W uoser

SNOG8IO-VX4VM TNvd

sowey aziuaq
YHws uaine
ueaoe Asupno)

AlioH

Buijaopy smao] alueyds)g

NIYD [PeydIN
Buleoy unsnp
UBWYISIH BUOY
aljpunig uoy
pieyulag AoueN
llopua4 uesng
sty ulg

uebay Aep
eas||dng ueug
allld xaly

AlIBN,0 A
Bingsiyjog uuinp
uosdwoy | uag
Jewln euusr
obeaq yiep
Woyg eohor
Kauulupno essIBIN
lawfed a9
Biagsiap Bigaq
uolaNYS uaine

BWION / @IqUION [ dweN

8G:60:L1 §102/0€/8
€V:80°L1 S§102/0¢/8
L2:0S:01 G10¢2/0€/8
6G:L¥0lL S1L0Z/0E/8
6€-¥E:0l G10Z/0E/8
LG:9¢:01 G102/0€/8
LE-€L:01 S10Z/0€/8
€1:85'6 GL02/0¢/8
L¥:€G'6 GL0Z/0E/8
vy:8¥'6 GL0Z/0€/8
£2:9¥'6 §102/0€/8
0L:e¥:6 SL0Z/0€/8
¢Zve6 S102/0€/8
¢0:€€:6 5102/0€/8
¥S:1€:6 GL02/0E/8
SE'vE8 G102/0E/8
00-6v:L S5102/0€/8
§0:G¢¥ G1.02/0€/8
8¢:60°1 GL02/0¢/8
96:0¢-€¢ §510¢2/62/8
L1:GL1€T §5102/62/8
¢2:l1:2Z S102/62/8
Zv80:LL GL02/62/8
Z0'G1:91 GL0¢2/62/8
L¥'6ES) §102/62/8
¢L:60:Gl GL0Z/62/8
8G:2L:€l §L0¢/62/8
£0-85:8 §10¢/62/8
¢l:G2:8 §10¢/62/8
P£:60:8 G1.02/62/8
£€:9€:L1 §10¢/8¢/8
6¥'G5°2) G10Z/82/8

dwejsawn



woo'|lewb@ppeler
woo’'lewb@ezoessar
woo'lewb@)|jeue e|s

wo lewb@sIunosjooiu
woo jlewb@siuedAssuy
jsuiseswoo®@uewssolble
npa'ebn@adodixs)
wo'lewb@uuelabiags|ape
woa ooyedA®@yzqdwesd
Wwoo ooyeA@splys pe
npa'syni@buoy Ajeq

wo2'lewb@eanaoww

. 18u'|eqo|Bags@zipueliap
wod lewb@isiseouop
woo’jewb@Anolpuaqg
npa'piealeyisod@yiua)e
woo lewb@zunyieuuy

woo ooyeA@ey osasyoweslo
Woo iew b@meysuediN

woo ewb@uosiaub-yieq

wo2'|lewb@ospirsayewMalpUY

woo'lewb@abpupleauuezi
woo|lewb@pleyuiaq uebal
woo yosyomy@siuuap

1au}seswoa@oIx

W02 uaI@Y2I|ge
J8uTiseswodr@uewniby
1BUspsmoyongoayi@uol
woo'lewb@ispamy a|[ayoiw
woo ooyeA®@ /86 L Asx1uy
[rew3

YIN "8lliAlaWwog “Z un J9a.1S uols|3 62
VI ‘8llinJawos "py uelund g€

g# IS euege

1S OJusWEIeS ¢

1S pysue gy

}9841§ uosyaIg 91

L090€ VO ‘suauly ‘g| 1dy 10 18JUAp 091
19918 JIBWWING gl

1S puepAeID 2|

9|INISWOS Z# IS PIOJXO 9|

any Jakmes ¢

1S ulpjueld gg

peoY sjliH ual o

6€006 VO ‘sejebuy so aay ebieT gpee
7rL20" 1S 18lpuey] ¢

1S plojp3N L82

¥1.208€ Xog 'O'd

anuaAe UOSLION L]

£€Z# 1S YIEL 901

any sisboy ¢¢

dllIiAlewos ‘anuaAy puelybiH 09¢
allinIBWOS ‘pY POOMUBID GG
a||InJBWos ‘pi poomualb gg

pPA|q asnoysapmod gtz

1921 UMONIOA /6

}sInujem gz|

S¥LZ0 |IMBWOS 1S PUBIRION €1 |
19918 awolar 9

1984} JAWWNS Z¥Z

¥¥7120 VIN "slliniewos ‘Jeaus ybiH Z
£7120 VIN ‘8llnswog ‘jealls sueqqio) /g
G120 BW ||IAJBLLOS 9AR B[epyal (|
odalapul / ugIdalIq / SSBIPPY

18ler Apaquupy
uebuiln sswer
By e|3

SIUND 8j02IN

0JB)0 BUIISIY
UBWSSOIS) Wepy
adod 1xa7
labiaqs|apy W\ uuy
lleqdwe) Apuip
SPIIY2 piempe
Apeg

IHequuljes) xa|y
YIBIDON-BNDON BSSIBIN
Zlpuelia4 piaeQ
la)sesuo(q auuin
Ano7 uag

AN YA TN ue|3 AsY

Zuny euuy

pleyoyud uesns
MmeysueT YIN
uosJaug yeg
abpup|3 malpuy
abpup|3 zn
pieyusag uebay
uewyos|4 siuuaq
pabpojg suuap
uieayy eiolep
Japapuaoijg malpuy
UBWINIS) SIIEH
pismoysangQ uor
1apamy| sy
[eyshuy

BWON / 3IQUION [ BWeN

8E'8¥'¢Z §102/0¢/8
Y0:L¥:2Z S1L02/0¢€/8
8¢:L2:¢C §10¢/0€/8
L€:60:22 S102/0¢/8
S0:L¥:LZ S10Z/0E/8
€1-9€:1Z S102/0¢E/8
L1:L2:1 € S5102/0€/8
PEZL:12 §10Z/0E/8
0Z:LL 12 S10Z/0€/8
81:¢1:0¢ S10¢/0¢/8
¢0:¢0:0¢ SlLoz/oe/8
8¢:2€61 G102/0¢€/8
¢0:80:6) S102/0€/8
60:15:81 S102/0¢/8
LO-v¥:8L SL0Z/0E/8
90:€L:LL §10Z/0¢E/8
¥1:80:LL GL0OC/0E/B
€0:91:91 S102/0¢/8
80:£1:91 S10Z/0¢E/8
¢Z:1e:gl GLoZ/0ge/8
250161 S102/0g/8
¥2:8€-vl G1L02/0¢/8
€0:81:¥L S102/0€/8
¥¥:00:7L S1L0Z/0€/8
¥¥:05:€L G10Z/0€E/8
Lp:92:Z1 S102/0E/8
6€-L¢:¢l §102/0E/8
0v:LL:Z) SL02/02/8
9G:1 121 91L02/0¢/8
¥£:60:Z1 GL0OZ/0E/8
€€:9€°L ] G1L02/0€/8

8v.¢¢:L1 G102/0¢/8
dwejsawi]



Bio°j108(0idswosjem@Aespur
woo lewb@yiuays-auel
woo'[oe@ieqiegmo
woo'|lewb®@ | zogsaleeld
wod ooyeA@Dg | cAlleqe en
woo lewb@ayel Alws

WO sAl|@UeAl|Ns” 8joolu
woo'|iewb@yjooq-uoyjeuo|
woo flewb@yoo1g| | dj
woo’|lewb@o|eaea aole
wo2' lewb@mo| ™y A|joH
wo'jlewb@yequolee
wod ooyeA@uirap}
wod[lewb@uaqy yypnl
npasiapuelq@Anbue

woo jlewb@usbaocibeurn
wod lewb@zoyole|uin|
woolewb@gganuowsyy
woo o0oyeA@Zy | LPIeleqy
woo ooyeA@uaqia|uowep

woo[lewb@gg L euel|r
woolewb@uewoey 1apuexa|e
npa 'nAu® | ozpuy

Wwo2' lewB@uUos)jom|euulio
wod lewb@yo|webalyasayiy

woo'|lewb@®)/ | suuey yued
leujseowod@eezgsAos Ul
woo ooyed@e | gelye]
woo'lewb@ Lueojs siuue

[rewd

g 1dy "aAy puejybiH go|

€# “1S PIojpaly L 8E

¥¥ 120 VIA 8lllnBwIog 188l ade|lep) 19
1@84)s senber 09

vrL20 YIN ‘eliaiewos 06 dy Aempeolg 0L€ L

VIN ‘@lIAIBWIOS |# enusAy siejs Aeg |9
VI 8lliiawog ‘| jdy Aemyled ujoour Ze

S¥120 VN @llinawos g0z 1dy Jeang senber 6z

9||IBWog Z 1dy 8y puelybiH Gl
£7120 VIN 8|IIAI8Wos 1S Jswwng /G|
IS uoybnoy gy

UapISaI B|IIAIBLIOS JOWIO)) GZ8E0 [N ‘UMOJYOUBLS ‘98NS Wig bZ

1S usal9 605

1S Bwung 16

IS eulned Lg

a|liAIBWOS 18 Mied 0L

L# 1S pieney 942

G120 VI 'eliinewos ‘19ens Agieq 6/
}s easjpYd 8z

E¥LZ0 1S UM 2

€# 1S Inujem Lg)

L# IS UOSpnH /1|

€120 19945 Aesieply ¢

GGLZ0 VIN 'PIOJpalN anuaAy swinH |/
GS120 VYN ‘PIOJPBIN 8NUBAY swny |/
VI ‘BlIIAWoS ‘eay puelybiH Sl
8|linuBwiog 18 ploteH gL

BAY onsAw

}Pa4s U9 pGL

v 1# oAy uosuieb |

biL20 ew 8[iAlawos 2, 1de Aempeoiq 9g9g |
€7LZ0 VIN "@|lAiswog "aay aueq HLZ
odalepug / ugIddalI(Q [ SSAIPPY

Ingipn Aespuli
[1isys suer
lagieg auuaye)
saleae] eneyd
Aleg epen

ageA Ajwg
BIMINAIYD Iysyeusaly
UeAl|INS 8J02IN
yloog uoyjeuor
ezz||jlad J181ad
OlieAe) Of|s|y eulisu) 81y
mo AjjoH
Jafkawaag uoiey
uiAeQg Wiy

uaqig yppnr
uaAnbN malpuy
Jabaolg) eunsun
Aairy ynp

shpe|9

IH Bai9

Haqie uoweq
AANT BUED
Youjedzy4 ueyp
uewoeH Japuexaly
uewl|iq 8|odlN-HaY
UOSJOAA BUULIOD
yojiwiebalyos sy
epela] aulenboep
suled yujed

uljiy suuelnpe
191UINOY UBYSLIY
ueo|S aluUYy

BWON / 2JQWION / BleN

geilgile g10z/Le/8
SZ'EL0Z SLoZ/LE/8
0¢:S0:0¢ SL0Z/LE/8
6€-95:61 GLOZ/LE/8
90'vZ:61 G1L0Z/LE/8
8G:61:L) SLOC/LE/B
€¥91:L) GLOEC/LEB
62:85°91 GL0Z/LE/8
LL¥S:91 GLOZ/LE/8
85:91:91 S510¢/1€/8
£€:91:91 SL02/LE/8
61:L5°GL GLOZ/LE/8
¢l2s'sl GL0Z/LE/8
8L:EV'SL G102/LE/8
¥Z-gevl SLOC/LE/R
6S:€ECl G1L0Z/LE/B
c0:0v:L 1L SLOZ/LE/8
8L:9¢:L L SL02/1e/8
SLvell SLoZ/LE/8
G0:2¥:01 SL0Z/LE/8
E¥:8G:6 GLOZ/LE/8

8€:95'6 G10¢/1€/8

9G-0€'6 SL0¢/LE/8

P£e:8 GL0Z/LE/8

0lL:€e:8 SL0Z/LE/8

§6:00:8 SL0¢/LE/8

LE:Le:0 §10Z/1E/8

90:G¢-0 §510¢2/1€/8

9¢:6¥-€2 G102/0€/8
€G:L1'€C G102/0¢/8
91:€0'€C §102/0¢/8

LE20'€C G102/0¢E/8
dwejsawi |



woo'[lewb@ieaymAiuuag
woolewi@zzouelewsssl
WO UdI@BS0IAD
Jau}SEOWO2M9sIql

woo ooyel@biagpeueys
woo ounf@paly|iiq
Ilewb@goyeissewy
woo'[lewb® g Aoseowlq
Woo'|leunoy@e8asAnIY
woo [lewb@abueideln|

woo'jlewb@ajymwiuewle
wod1oV®VVY11l3g

woo lewb@auiwser-siahp
woo'jlewb@aqdwedi)
woo'[lewb@uhisingeueys
woo ' lewb@z | gy204|

Bio ssajawoyew@A|ey
wo2'lewb@g  euealozy

woa lewb@ogpsie

woo'lewbmeiueydajsueseuer)

wod jlewb@sdibuosiapue.
wo) jewb@iofeyeuueor
woo'lewb@o| ¢/ wowladns
npa anysdwey®ssbw
woolewb@p|bael

woo ' jlewb@ p|bael

woa ocoyehA@lugnesanofiepy

Wwo2’lewb@plauyiunuosuey)a
woo'[lewb@)|ibeuocbow uajje
|lew3

T# 1904)S Aejereg vs

VIN ‘sliiniewos p1idy 1S umolsapey) #¢
Z 'OU aAny ploouod) €6

prLZ0 YIN ‘9|IIAIBWIOS "aAY Sawer 1S /
EvL20 ew h..“..___Em..tOw BAe pDIOJUOD L2
FPLZ0 YN alllnewos ‘19ang buin) ¢

1s Aqisp 12

EVLZ0 VN ‘SIIIAISWIOS ‘E# 199NS UOAY /9
GLZ0 BN 9||IAIaWOS L# }S jooid 6

L# 19948 mog |G

81 120 9NUBAY uosllieH 09t

1s uojdweypou g0z

L# Aempeoig v yG¢

BN ‘9|IMBWOS

Z# 199415 |00Y2S 66

Z 1dy ‘oA puejybiH L2z

y¥1L0 Slliewog ‘L# pY @adIssO €2
"9AY sulydasor G|

1S wewsy 0z

€120 SlIIAIaWOS ‘OAY Juesea|d ||
SPLZ0 VN "SlIBWOS “HL# IS yinoweq ¢
Sv120 ew a|iAtewos g jde Js ssoud /||
vrL20 VN ‘ellinawog ‘| jdy ‘aAy ajels Aeg 1.9
3|[I\IBWOS IS PUBRASID 40|

199415 yiedog

a|jinswos s buin ¢

602 1dy "any ab9|j0D Lz

602 1dy any 8bajj00 /g

9|IAIBLIOS IS UMO)saleYD 0L

‘1S uosueH g

L#1S Jswwng gLz

4€ 1dV ‘GAV NH3LSIM PLL
odal1apul / ugIooalI(] / SSBIPPY

1eayp Auusg
ouelepy eoissar
|eyiuasoy ukjpag
alld xa|ly

Jablaq eueys
pald g

yeissep xajy
AoJ|3oN uepualg
sobing euesng
20I9|[em elnp

ssig uely

UM IueLY
BloJBS) SLE
slaAp sulwser
lleqdwes ualf |
uAising eueys
Biagjepueiy eine
Kajng Ajjey

die |1ages)
julessno] ||ip
8U0IS Y Yleqez||3
uenaeue) aueydss
sdi9-uosiapuy asoy
1ojAe] euueop
9J|eiuep

peL aualep

Zie)) BNy

Zjey ainp

[lAJop @uueyor
SWEIIM alppeN
pIaid-lujuod ueylg
l16eUODIN us|ly
SLWON [ 9IQUWION [ BWEN

ov:8v.LL GL02/22/6
LZ:0¥:0C SL0Z/6L/6
0L:9%:L GL0Z/6L/6
8¥'¥0:LL GL0Z/8L/6
9€:6¢: 12 G102/0L/6
8L:¥S:01 SL02/9/6
0L:2£'6 S102/2/6
LL8¥'L §1L02/2/6
GZ'G2:0Z S1L0Z/L/6
£¥'90:0¢ 510¢/L/6
8G'€0'81 §10¢/L/6
00:G0°L1 SL0Z/L/6
61:80:GL G1L0Z/L/6
Y2:10:G1 S1L0Z/1/6
ceeevl S1L0¢/1L/6
¥0:62:¥L SLOZ/L/6
L2:SC'vL SL0T/LI6
Svivevl GLOZ/L/6
076071 GLOT/L/6
G080l SLOT/L/6
CcE8ELL S102/L/6
LE:8ELL SLOZ/L/B
Z:L0'LL SLOZ/LI6
¥¥:49°L GL0C/L/6
¢2:60:L GL0Z/L/6
€¥:85°9 GL0¢2/1/6
81212 §L0Z/L/6
82912 SL02/L/6
ZZ:eL0§L0g/LI6
€0:veieg S10g/1e/8
G1:85:2¢ S102/1€/8
P0¥S 12 GLOZ/LE/B
dwejsawi|



npa‘syn@uosLwUe|||im ele|d
woo'lewb@ jiaeusq

npe syni@Js|is epueliul
woo'lewb@bueyz AA epuewy
npa syni@Jenbualeq eueuew
woo lewb@wenw-uaaud
npasyn}@syo1pusy apelpue
woo'jlewb@geesi|seiw

npa synj@.elewAele
woo'lewb@e/Blaquiay easagal
woo'lewb®) | sbuiwwnojaiuep
woo|lewb@uolnesyjadde
woo'[lewb@eidoyoz | gwesed
woolewb@yousipouleliy
wod lewb@esiwinaisuow
woo'|lewb®@ya| | uosuelwAye
woo lewb@gzsuyey e
woolewjoy@ne(s yije

npa syni@eyal-soz

woa lewb@ee s wdm
woojlewb@doooaselb
woo'joe@uleziueflq
woo'|lewb@pauyspunwl
woo rewb@uisnwyes|

woo lewb@uewsaajiseyypn|
woo lewb@aubem ey
woo lewb@Auebapiydo
llew3

SGLe

peoy aadissQ 0/

Rysseniun syny |leH uaipm 910

1S ueuniym 8¢

Ay puowAey gg

Pd 18sung og

0€120 VIN ‘ule|d edlewer py Jojneag |Lg
peoy pueldn gz

9AY puowdey g

peocy pjsywoig g/

FFLZ0 'YIN ‘Slliinlawos Py sndwed 1smo Of
¥ LE0 9oelID | l8}sa g

any Jefmeg Gp

GG1L20 VIN ‘piojpa ‘Austenun syny |leH 1sem Lig
PPLZ0 VA ‘SlliABWOoS | 8Ay uclBweD §9
PrLZ0/VIN BllIAI8UWIOS/pROI JasuUNs ¢G

VI PlOjpaip 1S swepy g

BN "J8)sayaioq ‘z# 1S poomebply 62

r¥1L20 YIN slliAswos plexoed Q¢

Ay pleyoed G/

rY1L20 ‘YN ‘elliBWosS S JaYjemM 61

rr120 VIN ‘eliiswos S siung g/
Ausianiun syny

1S UBuWIymM G|

AN ‘'umolsialsiay ‘pY uewsle] £00EL
Ayssanun suny

V1 # SNUSAY UOSIPEW €€12

ad ai3idLliHmM 8

Y ‘BlIiiewios 48 Aouind m 001
193415 alowesAs of

1s Majjs £z

19941g PIOIXO #9

0dalepu / ugIdDalI(] [ SSBIPPY

nigsaN suuy
UOSWEI||IA Ble|D
[lueAy uiwelusg
UBLWISH uoley

Ja|IS epuBliy

Bueyz epuewny
lenbualag eueuep
USALH Weul
syoLpusy spelpue

eI

ysipey |seyoey
elqeJ/es oJwey

lefep Aely
oy|i4-sado eooagay
sBuiwwng jpiueqg
neny-jpddy 1o
eidoyn weled

louhey eiepy
Japlauyss-jawier eoI
UOSUBWAH Buuy
BWIWT

Hilv elpne|)

207

3o0)sualg Xe
ainToep Jaxied
Jadooq) aseig)

ulez lueAug

9100J\ qO2e[ uByjeuor
Jollaid-upisniy yean
UBWIBA|IS IpN[
Jaubem uney

Kuebaq uydo

SWON / 2IQUION / BWEN

8L:LL:LZ G102/0E/6
G1'60'1C GL0E/0E/6
LG:80:1¢ GL0C/0E/6
9€:L0°LZ S102/0¢E/6
GGL0:LZ S10Z/0¢/6
90:71:81 G1L0Z/0E/6
L0:€S°LL S102/0€E/6
¢r-eG:LL G102/0E/6
€0:9€7/1 S10Z/0¢/6
LP-L17-9l GL02/0E/6
Ly¥2:9l G102/0€/6
¢0:¥0'91 GLOZ/0E/6
LL:9vGL GL0Z/0E/6
y€:82:51 G102/0¢/6
¢2:9¢:S1 510¢/0¢/6
Llive:SL GL0Z/0E/6
CV.€2:G1 S10Z/0¢E/6
LP12:S1 SL02/0E/6
S¥:L1:S) GLOZ/0€E/6
LEZLGL GLOZ/0E/6
£0:80:G} G102/0€/6
SL:¥0'SL S102/0€/6
00-¥#0:Gl SL0Z/0E/6
S¥:20:G1 GL02/0¢€/6
¢G5 vL §10¢/0¢E/6
LEvPvL SLOZ/0E/6
0€:6evl G102/0¢E/6
S¥-0€-¥l S10Z/0€/6
¢L:82¥| S10Z/0E/6
9¥:00:Gl S102/6¢/6
vegeiLl G102/62/6

LG:0€:0C SLoZ/ve/e
dwejsawi|



woo'lewb@uew|spouriie|q
wos'lewb@euues| weyd
wo'[lewb@zosyoyo}
npa°syni@gLJe|jogas” sin|
woo'jlewb@aliam piaep'q

woo'|lewb@z | LniAjex
woo'[lewb@mepiaimes
woolewb@eg | uialsby

npe'sym®|leb yegezi3
wo2 ewb@gguosiawabp
woo jlewb@supjuifasol

wooiewb@BueduiAuipiey
woo'lewb@uewssiam|y

woo’jlewb@e|eplaz)
woo'lewb@o|jaJa) ByjuBWES
wod lewb@.s|ina‘edl|g
npa*syn}@)Ja|il euejuoWw
woo'|lewb@iebpLq ueuiay
npa'syn}@bBiaquayes eunz)

wo?'[lewb@wjnaep

woo jewb@Aayinuaysaie)o
npe‘syni@ulslsulaq lleyoez
woo lewb@maysaioyu
npa’synNi@nIgseu-aluuy
llew3

lIEH [seudiwied 0Ge

vr120 YN ‘alliAawos any 86200 £f
1S doayiuip L1

Vit 9AY 181sqap QL

Ay uo}sog 6¢

VIN ‘Piogpaly ‘aay Aysiaaiun |
anuaAy UapmoT] g

1ISI8L8 LES

anuaAy aba|jo0 60z

t¥120 VN ‘@IABWOS ‘BAY ||loMUoD £
Aussaniun syny

P¥120 VIN "8lliMaWos ‘aAy al8a] 61
rP1LZ0 VIN ‘@linIBWIO0S ‘BaAy 8ea ] 61
GS120 PIOJpaN “aAY 18)sayD g€

ane aba|0o /12

0ZSL€ VO Yoimsunig iS Aueq|y 828
Ay BIS8) €7

FP120 BN ‘SllIAIBWOS ‘pA|g @SNOH Japmod S8l
PY playwoig €6

1S doiyiuipn 0g

‘PY Jesung g¢

aou) Pauuag Lz

PH plaiwolg 98

PY puimiayo €z

8|jIuBwWos 1S UBWHUM ZZ

Ausianiun synyt

Austaniun syny

Aepp une ‘peoy sndwes 1amo O
Ayisianiun syny

GS1LZ0 VIN piojpajy ‘peoy sndwed 1emoT ¢

aAY UOJSOg 68E
a|linBWog ‘peoy sadissO 0L

odaispuUl / UOIDIAUQ / SSBIPPY

n7 Auiey
uewapop Jliejg
weyd euues
pPoyd uizus |
Jejlogay sinq
ule)sialiapg uag
SSI9A\-UIBISPIOD) eIRS
N7 Alfey

ma(q Johmesg

uisls ewwan) Ale|iH
puepy Asjeg
UINS AsupAs
UUINS AsupAs

8D Weqezi3
uossaws ofor
SUBjUIl 950y
yAzouomzQ aule|g
Bued uipiey

AueH

piay uosl||v
Biaquayolg |aplez)
ol|ale4 eyjueWwES
lapng efy3
BUBJLO

ueuwlay yJebpug
Biaquayeq eunz
[swiry uesungg
wiy In3 eq

allen

ulelsulag Aeyoez
H8{Y221D sejoydIN
HigseN suuy
BWoON [ aiquopN / aweN

L¥:0€:0 §102/2/01

60:10:12 GLOZ/L/0L
61:0€:0C §1L0Z/L/01
6€:20'81 GLOZ/L/0L
02-89-91 SL0g/L/01
LG'€C'GL §L0g/L/olL
60:¢L:¥l GL0Z/L/0L
L0°1G€L SL02/L/0L
00:£€7LL SLOZ/L/0L
92:0L:LL SL0Z/L/0L
G€-0G:01 SLOZ/L/0L
¥1:05:0L SL0Z/L/0L
G0:0G:01 SL0Z/L/0L
60:v€:6 GL0Z/L/0L

L¥:25:9 GL0Z/L/0L

€€:61:9 G102/L/01

9€:GE:L SLog/L/OL

vrce:l GLOZ/LI0L

L1-00-0 S1LOZ/L/0L

G€0S°€Z GLOZ/0E/6
L2-81-€¢ S10Z/0E/6
B6S:E¥€C G10¢/0€/6
00-0v:€€ S102/0¢/6
Sv:61:€C GL0Z/0E/6
60:245:22 G102/0E/6
96:9¢2:¢¢ §10¢/0¢€/6
L¥:01:¢¢ SL02/0€E/6
00:90:¢2 SL0¢/0€E/B
9v:6¥:1¢ G10Z/0E/6
vS:9t:LC GLOZ/0E/6
L1:42:12 S102/0€/6

Sv-LL:L2 G102/0E/6
dwejsawi|



