1 Big Belly Solar LLC
Blgbelly 150 A Street
Suite 103
Needham MA 02494
United States
888 820 0300
Bill To: Tax 1D:84-3362657

Dannielle Palazzo

City of Somerville MA

Somerville DPW Buildings and Grounds 17 Franey Rd
Somerville MA 02145

United States

All Together Better

Ship To:
Ben Waldrip

City of Somerville MA
Somerville DPW Buildings and Grounds 17 Franey Rd
Somerville MA 02145

United States

Terms Due Date PO #
Net 30 07/01/2024 CSA 10299-2 Part 1
Quantity Item
22 RN-WS-DBL-SC5.5-B-H-FP-CONNECT-LX

Connect LX Renewal

Sales Rep
Mark Koeck

17 Smart Double Stations wiith Chutes, Foot Pedals, and Message Panels

1 Smart Max/Smart Double Station with Hopper, Chute, Foot Pedal and

Message Panels

22 Element Double Stations with Chutes, Foot Pedals, and Message

Panels

1 Smart Single Station with Chute, Foot Pedals, and Message Panels

For the period 6/1/2024 to 6/30/2024

Remit To:

Big Belly Solar LLC
P.O. Box 849518
Boston MA 02284-9518
United States

ACH Information: Cambridge Savings Bank « Acct Name: Big Belly Solar LLC - Acct# 11728865 « Routing# 211371120

Subtotal

Tax

Shipping Cost
Total

Amount Paid

Amount Due

Invoice

#52508

06/01/2024

Shipping Method

Delivery

Rate

$186.53

Amount

$4103.58 V'

$4,103.58
$0.00
$0.00

$4,103.58

$0.00
$4,103.58

Wire Information: Citibank - Acct Name: Cambridge Savings Bank = Acct# 71160000000000093 « Swift# CITIUS33 » Routing# 031100209 + For Further

Credit To: 11728865, Big Belly Solar, LLC
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H Big Belly Solar LLC
!3'gbe"y 150 A Street
Suite 103
Needham MA 02494
United States
888 820 0300
Bill To: Tax ID:84-3362657

Dannielle Palazzo

City of Somerville MA

Somerville DPW Buildings and Grounds 17 Franey Rd
Somerville MA 02145

United States

All Together Better

Terms Due Date
Net 30 07/01/2024
Quantity Item
14 RN-WS-DBL-SC5.5-B-H-FP-CONNECT-LX

Connect LX Renewal

Ship To:
Ben Waldrip

City of Somerville MA
Somerville DPW Buildings and Grounds 17 Franey Rd
Somerville MA 02145

United States

CSA 10299-2 Part 2

Sales Rep
Mark Koeck

17 Smart Double Stations with Chute, Foot Pedals, and Message panels

1 Smart Max/Smart Double Station with Hopper, Chute, Foot Pedals, and

Message Panels

22 Element Double Stations with Chutes, Foot Pedals and Message

Panels

1 Smart Station with Chute, Foot Pedals, and Message Panels

For the period 6/1/2024 to 6/30/2024

Remit To:

Big Belly Solar LLC
P.O. Box 849518
Boston MA 02284-9518
United States

ACH Information: Cambridge Savings Bank + Acct Name: Big Belly Solar LLC « Acct# 11728865 « Routing# 211371120

Subtotal
Tax

Shipping Cost
Total

Amount Paid

Amount Due

Invoice

#52510
06/01/2024

Shipping Method

Delivery

Rate

$321.87

Amount

$4,506.14 \/

$4,506.14
$0.00
$0.00
$4,506.14

$0.00
$4,506.14

Wire Information: Citibank « Acct Name: Cambridge Savings Bank « Acct# 71160000000000093 « Swift# CITIUS33 « Routing# 031100209 - For Further

Credit To: 11728865, Big Belly Solar, LLC
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Danielle Palazzo

From: Danielle Palazzo

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 11:54 AM
To: Luke Ayotte

Subject: Re: BigBelly Invoice 49943 Reminder
Thankyou!!

From: Luke Ayotte <layotte@bigbelly.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 11:35:53 AM

To: Danielle Palazzo <DPALAZZO@somervillema.gov>
Subject: Re: FW: BigBelly Invoice 49943 Reminder

This email is from an external source. Use caution responding to it, opening attachments or
clicking links.

Hi Danielle,
Yes | can confirm you are all up to date through the end of the month.

Thank you!

On Wed, Jun 26, 2024 at 3:52 PM Danielle Palazzo <DPALAZZO@somervillema.gov> wrote:

Can you confirm if we are paid in full through June 30".
If not, what is outstanding?
Thanks!

Danielle

From: Luke Ayotte <layotte@bigbelly.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2024 3:49 PM

To: Danielle Palazzo <DPALAZZO @somervillema.gov>
Subject: Re: FW: BigBelly Invoice 49943 Reminder

This email is from an external source. Use caution responding to it, opening attachments or clicking links.
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Hello,

This is a friendly reminder that the attached invoice is past due. Be advised that late payment interest
will begin to accrue at this time and will continue until payment is received.

If payment has already been made, please provide payment details. Otherwise, please advise when we
can expect to receive payment.

Thank you,
BigBelly

accounting@bigbelly.com
888-820-0300

City of Somerville Public Records Notice

Please be advised that the Massachusetts Attorney General has determined that email is a public record
unless the content of the email falls within one of the stated exemptions under the Massachusetts Public
Records Laws.

Luke Ayotte

Accounts Receivable

150 A Street, Suite 103 | Needham, MA 02494 USA
+1 888.820.0300 main

+1 888.820.0300 Ext. 380

www.bigbelly.com

Rigbelly

All Together Better

Luke Ayotte

Accounts Receivable



